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Official Rules for the 2015 Lester Buildings – Toro® Mower (MN) Sweepstakes 
 
1. Sponsor: Lester Building Systems, LLC (d/b/a Lester Buildings), 1111 2nd Avenue South, 
Lester Prairie, MN (“Sponsor”) is offering the 2015 Lester Buildings - Toro® Mower (MN) 
Sweepstakes ("Sweepstakes"). NO LESTER BUILDINGS PURCHASE NECESSARY. A 
PURCHASE DOES NOT IMPROVE YOUR CHANCE OF WINNING. VOID WHERE 
PROHIBITED. 
 
2. Eligibility: Entrant must be eighteen (18) years of age or older as of 8/27/2015 and, except 
as provided in these Official Rules, a resident of the United States of America.  Residents of 
Florida, New York, Rhode Island and Tennessee are NOT eligible.  Employees of Sponsor, the 
Sponsor's subsidiaries, affiliated companies, and agents and the immediate family (defined as 
parents, spouse, children, siblings, grandparents) of each such employees or agents, and all 
those with whom such employees or agents are domiciled, are NOT eligible.  Any entry received 
from an ineligible individual will be deemed void.  By submitting an entry or accepting the prize, 
entrants accept and agree to be bound by these Official Rules and the decisions of the Sponsor, 
which shall be final on all matters. 
 
3. Timing: Sweepstakes begins at 8:01 a.m. CDT on Thursday, August 27, 2015 and ends at 
7:59:59 p.m. CDT on Monday, September 7, 2015 (“Sweepstakes Period”). Sponsor reserves 
the right to extend or shorten the contest or modify the Official Rules of the Sweepstakes in 
Sponsor’s sole discretion, subject to applicable federal and state law. 
 
4. How to Enter: Visit the Lester Buildings Exhibit Building at the Minnesota State Fair at 1473 
Underwood Street, St. Paul MN 55113 and complete the required entry information. Individuals 
may enter this Sweepstakes only once. More than one entry from any person will void all entries 
from that person.  All entries must be received by Sponsor during the Sweepstakes Period. 
 
5. Selection of Winner: This Sweepstakes will have one (1) Grand-Prize winner.  Each entrant 
selected as a potential winner must comply with all terms and conditions set forth in these 
Official Rules, and winning is contingent upon fulfilling all such requirements. One (1) Grand-
Prize winner will be selected from all entries submitted at random by Sponsor. The grand-prize 
drawing will be conducted on or about Tuesday, September 8, 2015.  The potential winner will 
be notified by email or phone on or about September 8, 2015. Potential winner must respond 
within seven (7) days of being notified or the Grand-Prize may be forfeited to another entrant 
chosen by Sponsor at random from all entries received.  This process shall be repeated as 
necessary until a potential winner selected at random by Sponsor is contacted and fulfills all 
other requirements of these Official Rules. 
 
6. Prize and Odds of Winning: One (1) Grand-Prize winner will win 1 (one) Toro® Z Master 
Zero Turn Lawn Mower – Commercial 2000 Series – Model # 74145 (ARV: $8,666.00). Odds of 
winning depend on the total number of eligible entries received.  Sponsor is not responsible for 
lost or mutilated prizes and none will be replaced. Prize is nontransferable and must be 
accepted as awarded. No cash or other substitution may be made, except by Sponsor in the 
event that the prize cannot be awarded for any reason, in which case, Sponsor will award a 
prize of equal or greater value. All taxes, fees and surcharges on prizes are the sole 
responsibility of winner.   
 
7. Other Terms and Conditions: By participating in the Sweepstakes, entrant warrants and 
represents that: Potential winner and any guest who will share in the prizes may be required to 
sign and return an Affidavit of Eligibility & Liability, Indemnity, and Publicity Release, within 
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seven (7) days of notification, failing which the potential winner will be disqualified and another 
winner selected by Sponsor in the place of the disqualified person at random from all entries 
received. If any prize or prize notification is returned as non-deliverable, the potential winner will 
be disqualified and another potential winner will be selected in the original potential winner's 
place. By accepting the prize, the winner agrees that the Sponsor and those acting under the 
Sponsor's authority, may use winner's name, picture/portrait likeness and/or voice, for 
advertising and promotional purposes without further consideration, unless prohibited by law. 
BY ACCEPTING THE PRIZE, THE WINNER AGREES THAT THE SPONSOR, ITS 
SUBSIDIARIES, AFFILIATES, ADVERTISING AND PROMOTION AGENCIES, AND EACH 
OF THE SPONSOR'S OWNERS, OFFICERS, MANAGERS, DIRECTORS, GOVERNORS, 
EMPLOYEES, REPRESENTATIVES AGENTS AND ADVISORS WILL HAVE NO LIABILITY 
WHATSOEVER FOR, AND WILL BE HELD HARMLESS BY WINNER FOR ANY LIABILITY 
FOR ANY INJURY, LOSS OR DAMAGES OF ANY KIND TO PERSONS, INCLUDING 
DEATH, AND PROPERTY, DUE IN WHOLE OR IN PART, DIRECTLY OR INDIRECTLY, 
FROM THE ACCEPTANCE, POSSESSION, USE OR MISUSE OF THE GRAND-PRIZE OR 
PARTICIPATION IN THIS SWEEPSTAKES OR PARTICIPATION IN ANY SWEEPSTAKES 
OR PRIZE RELATED ACTIVITY. Subject to all federal, state and local laws. Void where 
prohibited. 
 
8. Miscellaneous: All entries become the sole property of Sponsor and none will be returned. If 
for any reason the Sweepstakes is not capable of running as planned, including due 
unauthorized intervention, fraud, technical failure, human error or any other causes beyond the 
control of Sponsor that corrupt or affect the administration, security, fairness, integrity, or proper 
conduct of the Sweepstakes, Sponsor reserves the right in its sole discretion, to disqualify any 
individual who tampers with the entry process, and to cancel, terminate, modify or suspend the 
Sweepstakes, subject to applicable federal and state law. Sponsor assumes no responsibility for 
any error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, 
or alteration of, entries. Sponsor is not responsible for late, lost, illegible, unintelligible, 
incomplete, stolen, or misdirected entries or for inaccurate entry information. CAUTION: ANY 
ATTEMPT BY AN ENTRANT TO DELIBERATELY DAMAGE OR UNDERMINE THE 
LEGITIMATE OPERATION OF THE SWEEPSTAKES MAY BE A VIOLATION OF CRIMINAL 
AND CIVIL LAWS AND SHOULD SUCH AN ATTEMPT BE MADE, SPONSOR RESERVES 
THE RIGHT TO SEEK DAMAGES FROM ANY SUCH PERSON TO THE FULLEST EXTENT 
PERMITTED BY LAW. 
 
9. Identification of Winners and Official Rules: For an identification of the winner or a copy of 
the Official Rules, send a stamped self-addressed envelope for receipt by October 1, 2015 to 
Lester Building Systems LLC, Marketing, 1111 2nd Avenue South, Lester Prairie MN 55354. 
 
10. Limitation of Liability and Dispute Resolution.  Except where prohibited by law, each 
entrant agrees that: (a) all issues and questions concerning these Official Rules shall be 
governed by Minnesota law without giving effect to any principles of conflicts of law of any 
jurisdiction; (b) any and all disputes, claims and causes of action at law or in equity arising out of 
or relating to this program or any prize awarded shall be (i) resolved individually, without resort 
to any form of class action; and (ii) submitted to final and binding arbitration to be held in 
Hennepin County, Minnesota, before a single arbitrator; (c) any and all claims, judgments and 
awards shall be limited to actual out-of-pocket costs incurred, but in no event attorney’s fees; 
and (d) under no circumstances will any entrant be permitted to obtain awards for and hereby 
waives all rights to claim punitive, incidental, special, consequential damages and any other 
damages, other than for actual out of pocket expenses, and any and all rights to have damages 
multiplied or otherwise increased. 


